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Deliverance from Deception and Counterfeit Spirits    
 
 

Today I’m going to be praying against spirits of deceit. The devil is a serpent that tries 
to trick people. That is the nature of the devil, he is a liar and deceiver. It would only 
make sense that we need deliverance in areas where we are deceived by the enemy, like 
regarding Biblical doctrine.  
 
There are different ways the enemy uses. He will try to mimic the voice of God or your 
mind or conscience. Temptations appeal to the mind, emotions or body. The enemy 
tells people there won’t be any consequences if they sin, or accept ideas that are 
against God’s word.  But there are always consequences. 
 
Before we begin, make sure you’re in a comfortable, quiet place. You can simply receive 
this prayer in the name of Jesus.  May you all be blessed in Jesus’s name. May your 
minds all be blessed as you receive this prayer. I pray you will receive God’s truth, God’s 
light, and powerful breakthrough in the name of Jesus Christ. 
 
Father, I thank you that my brothers and sisters have the minds of Christ. I thank you 
that they have on the helmet of salvation. I thank You that Your word says the scriptures 
make us wise. I thank You that Christ is the power of God and the wisdom of God, 
according to 1 Corinthians. 
 
Father, I pray that we would have the wisdom of God. Father, I thank you that Your word 
says that You will give us a wisdom that our adversaries cannot come up against nor 
gainsay. In the name of Jesus Christ, we come against every demonic spirit that tries to 
bring deception or seduction. 
 
God’s word says that in the latter days people will give heed to seducing spirits and 
doctrines of devils. I come against seducing spirit that lead people into false doctrine. I 
pray the fire of God from the top of their head to the soles of their feet. Burn up now, 
spirits of deception, spirit- of delusion, every spirit of self-deception. 
 
Father God, I pray all demons of laziness and procrastination be removed. I pray that 
your children would be given a love of studying Your word. Let them study to show 
themselves approved, as a workman that needs not to be ashamed, rightly dividing the 
word of truth.  Father, we thank you and give you praise in Jesus’s mighty name  
 
Every demon that makes people unwilling to search out Biblical truth on a topic, to study 
the for themselves, come out. Father, I pray that these spirits would be driven out in the 
name of Jesus Christ. I pray, that their minds would be made whole. Every spirit of 
confusion and deception, come out. Every octopus or squid spirit that came in through 
religious cults, I pray that they will be driven out in the name of the Lord Jesus Christ.  
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Father, in Jesus’s mighty name, I pray the fire of the Holy Ghost against every spirit of 
deception. Every deceiving spirit that offers them excuses to sin or to keep sinning, I 
pray those will be removed in the name of Jesus.  
 
Every spirit of pride that makes people think they cannot be deceived, and that they are 
always right, I pray that pride be removed in Jesus’s name. Every spirit that talks people 
out of asking for counsel from others, I command it removed in the name of Jesus.  
 
Every serpent or jungle spirit, I command it to come out in the name of Jesus. Every 
spirit that deceives people with the lust of the eyes, lust of the flesh, and the pride of life, 
be removed now in the name of Jesus. Every demon that brings false doctrines or a 
false gospel, be removed right now in the name of the Lord Jesus Christ. 
 
We command every demonic spirit to flee in the mighty name of Jesus. Come out of the 
mind, out of the heart. Witchcraft spirits, come out right now. Any witchcraft spirits that 
came through false doctrines of control, I pray they be removed in the name of Jesus. 
 
Father, any soul ties that my brothers and sisters have to false teachers, I pray those be 
broken now in the name of Jesus. Anybody that accept a doctrine without weighing it 
against the scriptures, I pray You would convict them in the name of Jesus.  
 
Every spirit of deception or rejection that opens the way for people to accept lies that 
comfort them, I pray they will be removed in the name of Jesus. We command every 
demonic spirit to flee right now. Every demon that is sitting on top of the head or the 
neck, come out right now. Come out, spirits. We command you to flee right now. 
 
Father, every demon that tries to mimic the Holy Spirit, I pray that it be exposed in the 
mighty name of Jesus. Every demon that hinders people from checking the fruit, the or 
the origin when hearing a voice they believe is the Lord’s, come out in Jesus’s name. 
 
In the name of Jesus, every demonic spirit that leads people astray, that uses people’s 
good intentions against them, be removed in the name of Jesus. Demonic voices that 
whisper to people at night, I pray those be cast into the pit right now in the name of 
Jesus. Come out, spirits of condemnation. Come out, spirits that give a works-based 
perception of God’s love. I command those spirits to go right now.  
 
Come out, spirits of unworthiness. Spirits of false humility, come out in the name of 
Jesus. Every spirit of unworthiness, go in the name of the Jesus. Come out 
spirits…come up and out of the body. Come up and out of the mind. Pack your bags and 
go! Every demon in the mind, come out in the name of the Lord Jesus Christ.  
 
  



3  

Father, I pray fire all through their body. I loose the Holy Spirit’s fire of destruction and 
judgment into Satan’s kingdom in the mighty name of the Lord Jesus Christ. Father, I 
pray that Your fire would refine their souls. I pray that Your fire would go through their 
souls right now in the name of the Lord Jesus Christ.  
 
Every demon that makes people hate certain teachers of God, I pray those demons be 
removed now in the name of the Jesus. Demons that deceive people into hating, 
slandering or reviling ministers of God, come out in the name of Jesus. Wicked devils of 
strife and division, come out right now. Every demon that causes division in the church, 
come out in the name of Jesus. We command you wicked spirits to flee. Come out!   
 
Demons that make you think you know the intentions of other people, when you don’t, I 
command them to go right now. Every spirit of pride that makes people assume the 
intentions of ministers, brothers and sisters, I command it to go now.  
 
Every demon that makes people doubt sermons that do not have a verse in every 
sentence, be removed in the name of Jesus. Hypocritical judgment, come out. Come 
out of their eyes, spiritual logs. We command hypocrisy to come out of their eyes right 
in the name of the Jesus. Every demon of spiritual pride that masquerades as 
discernment, I command it to go right now.  
 
Cold heartedness, come out now. Cold-heartedness that masquerades as wisdom or 
discernment, I command it to go out in the name of Jesus. Father, I pray for harmony 
between their mind and heart in the name of the Jesus. Father God, we thank you. Every 
demonic spirit, come out. You devils must leave in Jesus Christ’s mighty name.     
 
Every demon that deceives people about which church to go to, come out. Come all the 
way out. Be bound, demons, in the name of Jesus. Father, I pray more fire from the top 
of their head to the soles of their feet. Come up and out, spirits. Come all the way out in 
the name of the Jesus. Loose your hold and come out of their mind, spirits.  
 
Demons that make people want to give up because they didn’t hear God properly, I 
command them to go right now. Feeling discouraged because you misheard God one 
time, I command it to go in the name of Jesus.  Come all the way up and out of the 
mind. Go right now. We burn you devils out in the name of the Jesus.  
 
Flee right now. Come out of their mind, come out of the heart, come out, you wicked 
spirits. Every demon that tries to corrupt their mind with worldly wisdom or desires, I 
command it to burn up right now. Jesus, please give them discernment when their 
desires are ungodly before they yield to them  
 
Every spirit that makes people use worldly wisdom to interpret the Bible, come out in 
Jesus’s name. Every demon that gives people a wrong interpretation of a scripture, 
come out. Demons that get people to use the natural mind to interpret scripture, I 
command it to go in the name of Jesus.   
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We should be biblical, but we also shouldn’t be bible parrots. In Jesus’s name, I pray 
more fire from the top of the head to the soles of the feet. Come out spirits. Come up 
and out, up and out. Every religious spirit, come out right now in the name of Jesus. 
Religious spirits, come out right now. We command you to go in the name of Jesus.  
 
Every religious spirit that deceives people into being a Pharisee, I pray that’ll be driven 
out in the name of the Jesus. Come up and out, spirits, right now. We pull you loose in 
Jesus’s name.  I pray that your angels would take sickles, that they would take javelins 
and swords and cut apart the kingdom of darkness in the name of Jesus. 
 
Father, I pray they would have the spirit of wisdom and revelation in the knowledge of 
You, the eyes of their understanding being enlightened, that they might know the hope 
of their calling. We thank you, Father God. Please pour out upon them fresh revelation.  
 
Every demon that blocks revelation or understanding, every demon that blocks sound 
thinking, I pray it be removed in the name of the Lord Jesus Christ. Come up and out, 
demons. Go, go, go, go. Every demon that that tempts you to compromise sound 
doctrine because of the fear of man, come out.  
 
Every demon that tempts you to compromise because of needs, I command it to go 
right now. Go, spirits, go. Go, go, go, go, go in Jesus’s name. Demons of unsound 
doctrines, I command it to go. Fault-finding spirits, go right now. Out, out, out, and out in 
the mighty name of Jesus. We command you wicked devils to go.  
 
We command you wicked devils to go out of their mind and their chest. Expel out of the 
body. We’re not playing, demons. I’m addressing you demons in the name of Jesus 
Christ. I loose the artillery of God against you and I command you out in the name of 
Jesus. I command you out of their mouths.  Come out right now.  
 
Deception, seduction, come out in the name of Jesus. Worldly wisdom, come out. Come 
all the way up and out of the body right now. Loose your hold and go in Jesus Christ’s 
mighty name. Every spirit of doubting the word of God, come out.  Doubting God’s truth, 
come out. Fear of taking a stand for God’s position on something, come out now.  
 
Come out, demons of fear of ever being wrong. Every demon that steals self confidence 
from people, come out. Stealing confidence in the word of God, or what God has shared 
with them, be driven out in the name of Jesus. Come out right now in Jesus’s name. 
 
Every octopus spirit of mind control, leave. Mind control, leave. Mind control, detach 
from the head in the name of Jesus. Detach from the head in the name of Jesus Christ. 
Every demon that blocks common sense and proper thinking, come out. You devils have 
to leave in Jesus Christ’s name. 
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Every spirit of deception embedded in the neurons of the brain, come out in the name of 
Jesus Christ. We cut you devils with the sword of the spirit in the mighty name of Jesus. 
Come up and out of the body, up and out. Go right now, in Jesus’s name. We loose 
division into the ranks in the of the enemy now in Jesus’s name.  
 
Come out, obsession with strange doctrines. Father, your word says that we should not 
be carried about with strange doctrines. Loose them, every demon that makes them 
fascinated with the illuminati and the new world order.  Come out in Jesus’s name. 
 
I pray that any obsessions would be removed in the name of Jesus. Come out, spirits. 
Come up and out of the body right now.  Come out in the mighty name of Jesus. Any 
demons that are still manifesting, be driven out right now in the name of Jesus. 
 
Lord, your word says, ‘if the blind follow the blind, will they not both fall into a ditch?’  
I pray that my brothers and sisters would not end up in a theological ditch. I pray that 
they be pulled out of any ditch in Jesus Christ’s mighty name. Thank you, Holy Spirit, for 
guiding them into all truth. Please give them Your revelation, wisdom and knowledge in 
Jesus Christ’s mighty name. 
 
I thank you, Father, for giving them power, love and a sound mind. I pray, Father, that 
they would be able to think clearly. Thank you that they will be able to accurately weigh 
every doctrine against scripture.  
 
Please fill them, Father, with the Holy Spirit right now in Jesus’s name. Please fill them 
from the top of their head to the soles of their feet. Father, please fill the empty places, 
please renew their minds. I pray that their minds would function properly. In Jesus’s 
name, we pray. 
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